
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 

national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 

(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: 19-049V Tentative Board Meeting Date*: AUGUST 07, 2018 

ITB Title: TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & # Notified: 1,430 # Downloaded:      77 

CONSULTING SERVICES 
# of Responses Rec’d: 44 # of “No Bids”: 1 

For: INFORMATION & TECHNOLOGY ITB Opening Date : JULY 25, 2018 

(School/Department)

Fund: DEPARTMENT’S OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: MAY 16, 2018 

POSTING OF Select One RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement 

& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on July 27, 2018 @ 8:00 am and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person who is adversely 

affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended 

decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or 

failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The 

formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during 

which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of 

Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting 

an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward 

County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 

3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 

date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

VENDOR NAME(S)    ITEM AWARDED 

22nd Century Technologies, Inc. 1-57

4 Best Business Corp. ** 1-57

A & Associates ** 1-9; 14-18; 20-22; 24-32; 40-50; 52-57

Abacus Service Corp.  1-57

Alpha 1 Staffing 1-38; 40-41; 43-57

B2B Technologies South, LLC 1-6; 11; 14-18; 31-32; 41-50; 52-54

Beacon Systems, Inc. ** 1-57

Bleu Stream Corporation 1-4; 7-19; 21-32; 40-52; 54; 56-57

C & C International Computers & Consultants, Inc. **   1-8; 10-12; 14-18; 21-22; 27-30; 33-57

Capgemini America, Inc. d/b/a Sogeti USA  1-19; 21-54; 57

Cogent Infotech Corp.  1-57

Dell Marketing LP 40-54; 57

Diane Meiller & Associates Incorporated 15-16; 41; 43; 45-46; 53; 57

Elegant Enterprise Wide Solutions, Inc. 1-57

Gartner Inc. 14-18; 41-46; 48-49; 53; 57

Genesis Consulting Partners LLC 1-57

Global Visse, Inc. 1-57

Hyper Team USA Business and IT Consulting, Inc. 1-6; 11; 13-18; 24; 26; 31-32; 40-46; 54; 57

Instaff Solutions, LLC 2-13; 15-38; 41-57

Intelli ERP Software, LLC 1-57

JDL Technologies 5-6; 21-22; 30; 44-50

Michael Clark LLC d/b/a Gravity IT Resources LLC          1-54; 57

Millennium Technology Group, LLC ** 5-8; 13-19; 21-32; 40-46; 49-50; 56-57
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RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

BID 19-049V – TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES 

VENDOR NAME(S)         ITEM AWARDED

PSR Associates 1-57

Packplus, Inc. d/b/a Josmar Medical Staffing  1-57

Precision Staffing, Inc. d/b/a AP Recruiters & Assoc. 1-57

RadGov Inc.  1-57

Ranger Technical Resources, Inc. **  1-55; 57

Sierra Infosys, Inc. 1-57

Sigman & Summerfield 1-57

Software Information Resource Corp – SIRC 1-57

Synergy Solutions Partners, LLC 5-8; 13-19; 21-32; 40-46; 49-50; 56-57

Tech Army, LLC 1-57

Tek Partners Solutions LLC  1-57

TRG, Inc. 1-57

Visium Resources, Inc. 1-57

Vitaver & Associates, Inc. **  1-57

We R Artemis Leadership 24-29; 57

Whitaker Taylor 1-6; 14-18; 21-22; 33-38; 40-46; 57

** REPRESENTS S/M/WBE CERTIFIED VENDORS 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND 

CONDITIONS.  

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS 

STATED, EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR A PARTICULAR ITEM(S) LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING 

WITH BID REQUIREMENTS. 

CONTRACT PERIOD:  SEPTEMBER 1, 2018 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2020 

By: Date: July 26, 2018 

(Purchasing Agent) 
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1 32.00$    52.50$    60.00$    41.40$    63.25$    115.00$     50.00$    $35.00 $37.09 92.31$    52.00$    No Bid No Bid 66.00$    No Bid 70.00$    48.00$    75.00$    No Bid 35.00$    

2 35.00$    63.00$    65.00$    48.30$    74.75$    125.00$     55.00$    $40.00 $47.31 96.92$    65.00$    No Bid No Bid 72.00$    No Bid 90.00$    54.00$    85.00$    80.00$    42.00$    

3 41.00$    73.50$    67.00$    55.20$    86.25$    135.00$     60.00$    $48.00 $57.32 101.54$     80.00$    No Bid No Bid 81.00$    No Bid 110.00$     60.00$    90.00$    95.00$    47.00$    

4 47.00$    89.25$    75.00$    62.10$    97.75$    145.00$     65.00$    $58.00 $62.81 107.69$     98.00$    No Bid No Bid 96.00$    No Bid 125.00$     65.00$    95.00$    110.00$     59.00$    

5 41.00$    68.25$    27.00$    57.96$    109.25$     145.00$     55.00$    No Bid $56.03 100.00$     75.00$    No Bid No Bid 78.00$    No Bid 100.00$     60.00$    90.00$    100.00$     45.00$    

6 50.00$    78.75$    27.00$    66.24$    132.25$     155.00$     65.00$    No Bid $67.69 107.69$     108.00$     No Bid No Bid 90.00$    No Bid 125.00$     67.00$    100.00$     115.00$     49.00$    

7 54.00$    89.25$    33.00$    63.48$    115.00$     No Bid 70.00$    $58.00 $63.34 107.69$     90.00$    No Bid No Bid 83.00$    No Bid 100.00$     65.00$    No Bid 120.00$     65.00$    

8 55.00$    84.00$    35.00$    82.80$    126.50$     No Bid 72.00$    $65.00 $64.72 123.08$     100.00$     No Bid No Bid 92.00$    No Bid 135.00$     65.00$    No Bid 175.00$     115.00$     

9 35.00$    89.25$    36.00$    62.10$    124.20$     No Bid 73.60$    $58.00 No Bid 107.69$     85.00$    No Bid No Bid 83.00$    No Bid 100.00$     65.00$    No Bid 120.00$     69.00$    

10 41.00$    78.75$    No Bid 64.86$    103.50$     No Bid 72.00$    $65.00 $61.41 100.00$     95.00$    No Bid No Bid 82.00$    No Bid 85.00$    65.00$    No Bid 120.00$     69.00$    

11 49.00$    89.25$    No Bid 62.10$    109.25$     140.00$     65.00$    $58.00 $61.45 107.69$     78.00$    No Bid No Bid 90.00$    No Bid 85.00$    65.00$    100.00$     125.00$     60.00$    

12 36.00$    78.75$    No Bid 57.96$    103.50$     No Bid 65.00$    $60.00 $51.87 107.69$     90.00$    No Bid No Bid 82.00$    No Bid 90.00$    65.00$    No Bid 120.00$     65.00$    

13 40.00$    73.50$    No Bid 62.10$    109.25$     No Bid 65.00$    $45.00 No Bid 100.00$     102.00$     No Bid No Bid 72.00$    No Bid 80.00$    65.00$    85.00$    90.00$    60.00$    

14 33.00$    63.00$    60.00$    41.40$    80.50$    120.00$     56.00$    $30.00 $42.43 100.00$     40.00$    No Bid No Bid 65.00$    230.00$     90.00$    45.00$    95.00$    NO BID 42.00$    

15 38.00$    67.20$    62.00$    52.44$    92.00$    135.00$     64.00$    $36.00 $52.06 107.69$     60.00$    135.00$     No Bid 72.00$    345.00$     110.00$     55.00$    105.00$     90.00$    47.00$    

16 47.00$    76.65$    65.00$    62.10$    103.50$     150.00$     72.00$    $44.00 $60.90 115.38$     75.00$    150.00$     No Bid 82.00$    390.00$     125.00$     60.00$    115.00$     105.00$     59.00$    

17 36.00$    68.25$    51.00$    55.20$    86.25$    145.00$     65.00$    $55.00 $60.86 100.00$     60.00$    No Bid No Bid 72.00$    345.00$     75.00$    55.00$    100.00$     105.00$     49.00$    

18 42.00$    81.90$    61.00$    63.48$    103.50$     160.00$     70.00$    $65.00 $70.75 107.69$     80.00$    No Bid No Bid 84.00$    390.00$     85.00$    60.00$    110.00$     125.00$     55.00$    

19 36.00$    73.50$    No Bid 48.30$    103.50$     No Bid 56.00$    $65.00 No Bid 107.69$     65.00$    No Bid No Bid 72.00$    No Bid 115.00$     50.00$    No Bid 90.00$    39.00$    

20 42.00$    63.00$    39.00$    48.30$    97.75$    No Bid 51.20$    No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid No Bid 84.00$    No Bid 90.00$    60.00$    No Bid 100.00$     33.00$    

21 23.00$    42.00$    25.50$    27.60$    57.50$    No Bid 25.00$    $30.00 $40.46 61.54$    25.00$    No Bid No Bid 55.00$    No Bid 50.00$    45.00$    No Bid 50.00$    33.00$    

22 28.00$    47.25$    30.00$    33.12$    69.00$    No Bid 30.00$    $35.00 $47.42 69.23$    42.00$    No Bid No Bid 64.00$    No Bid 60.00$    50.00$    No Bid 55.00$    35.00$    

23 33.00$    52.50$    No Bid 55.20$    109.25$     No Bid 60.00$    $35.00 No Bid 107.69$     70.00$    No Bid No Bid 80.00$    No Bid 65.00$    55.00$    No Bid 100.00$     35.00$    

24 42.00$    68.25$    31.50$    59.34$    103.50$     No Bid 65.00$    $55.00 No Bid 107.69$     65.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 100.00$     55.00$    110.00$     110.00$     39.00$    

25 44.00$    68.25$    31.50$    49.68$    103.50$     No Bid 65.00$    $40.00 No Bid 107.69$     70.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 115.00$     55.00$    No Bid 90.00$    40.00$    

26 44.00$    63.00$    31.50$    48.30$    86.25$    No Bid 65.00$    $55.00 No Bid 100.00$     65.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 100.00$     50.00$    110.00$     110.00$     39.00$    

27 44.00$    63.00$    31.50$    51.06$    103.50$     No Bid 65.00$    $55.00 $46.43 107.69$     70.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 100.00$     45.00$    No Bid 90.00$    35.00$    

28 44.00$    63.00$    31.50$    55.20$    97.75$    No Bid 65.00$    $40.00 $46.43 107.69$     80.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 125.00$     50.00$    No Bid 90.00$    37.00$    

29 47.00$    78.75$    35.00$    48.30$    103.50$     No Bid 70.00$    $30.00 $46.43 100.00$     75.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 145.00$     55.00$    No Bid 135.00$     39.00$    

30 23.00$    36.75$    25.00$    27.60$    74.75$    No Bid 25.00$    $30.00 $46.05 53.85$    60.00$    No Bid No Bid 60.00$    No Bid 50.00$    45.00$    No Bid 80.00$    30.00$    

31 39.00$    73.50$    30.00$    62.10$    103.50$     145.00$     64.00$    $48.00 No Bid 100.00$     85.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 115.00$     55.00$    100.00$     100.00$     60.00$    

32 34.00$    68.25$    30.00$    51.06$    103.50$     135.00$     60.00$    $35.00 No Bid 92.31$    88.00$    No Bid No Bid 75.00$    No Bid 70.00$    55.00$    90.00$    105.00$     60.00$    

33 54.00$    115.50$     No Bid 62.10$    174.80$     No Bid 68.80$    No Bid $65.83 138.46$     85.00$    No Bid No Bid 95.00$    No Bid 150.00$     65.00$    No Bid 175.00$     149.00$     

34 48.00$    105.00$     No Bid 75.90$    144.90$     No Bid 80.00$    No Bid $74.43 123.08$     75.00$    No Bid No Bid 107.00$     No Bid 150.00$     65.00$    No Bid 165.00$     135.00$     

35 51.00$    120.75$     No Bid 75.90$    144.90$     No Bid 80.00$    No Bid $45.81 138.46$     80.00$    No Bid No Bid 115.00$     No Bid 150.00$     75.00$    No Bid 175.00$     135.00$     

36 44.00$    99.75$    No Bid 51.06$    138.00$     No Bid 80.00$    No Bid $56.44 123.08$     60.00$    No Bid No Bid 115.00$     No Bid 150.00$     65.00$    No Bid 175.00$     135.00$     

37 56.00$    99.75$    No Bid 82.80$    144.90$     No Bid 80.00$    No Bid $149.00 138.46$     70.00$    No Bid No Bid 115.00$     No Bid 150.00$     65.00$    No Bid 175.00$     149.00$     

38 63.00$    120.75$     No Bid 103.50$     181.70$     No Bid 80.00$    No Bid $60.00 153.85$     90.00$    No Bid No Bid 132.00$     No Bid 170.00$     80.00$    No Bid 190.00$     169.00$     

39 40.00$    63.00$    No Bid 33.12$    No Bid No Bid 60.00$    No Bid $38.27 123.08$     60.00$    No Bid No Bid 93.00$    No Bid 80.00$    50.00$    No Bid No Bid 74.00$    

40 42.00$    68.25$    42.00$    52.44$    97.75$    No Bid 60.00$    $30.00 $42.86 107.69$     50.00$    No Bid 145.00$     78.00$    No Bid 95.00$    55.00$    80.00$    No Bid 60.00$    

41 43.00$    78.75$    45.00$    57.96$    115.00$     125.00$     64.00$    $35.00 $55.54 123.08$     63.25$    130.00$     170.00$     93.00$    230.00$     115.00$     60.00$    90.00$    105.00$     70.00$    

42 50.00$    94.50$    50.00$    64.86$    No Bid 135.00$     70.40$    $42.00 $65.98 130.77$     80.50$    No Bid 230.00$     118.00$     345.00$     130.00$     65.00$    100.00$     115.00$     80.00$    

43 63.00$    99.75$    55.00$    75.90$    138.00$     145.00$     80.00$    $48.00 $76.61 140.00$     97.75$    160.00$     240.00$     135.00$     390.00$     150.00$     65.00$    110.00$     125.00$     90.00$    

44 42.00$    63.00$    63.00$    48.30$    86.25$    125.00$     50.00$    $45.00 $43.62 92.31$    60.00$    No Bid 235.00$     78.00$    230.00$     95.00$    45.00$    90.00$    105.00$     42.00$    

45 46.00$    73.50$    63.00$    55.20$    97.75$    135.00$     55.00$    $55.00 $53.45 100.00$     75.00$    175.00$     250.00$     93.00$    345.00$     115.00$     50.00$    100.00$     115.00$     47.00$    

46 50.00$    84.00$    63.00$    62.10$    109.25$     145.00$     65.00$    $60.00 $61.32 107.69$     90.00$    200.00$     295.00$     107.00$     390.00$     130.00$     55.00$    110.00$     125.00$     59.00$    

47 55.00$    110.25$     38.00$    75.90$    132.25$     165.00$     80.00$    $65.00 $68.66 123.08$     95.00$    No Bid 300.00$     115.00$     No Bid 75.00$    70.00$    No Bid 125.00$     60.00$    

48 44.00$    105.00$     38.00$    69.00$    109.25$     160.00$     64.00$    $60.00 $69.12 123.08$     85.00$    No Bid 300.00$     115.00$     345.00$     75.00$    70.00$    No Bid 115.00$     55.00$    

49 51.00$    89.25$    38.00$    62.10$    103.50$     155.00$     75.20$    $65.00 $73.73 107.69$     87.00$    No Bid 294.00$     95.00$    390.00$     90.00$    65.00$    No Bid 145.00$     55.00$    

50 36.00$    78.75$    35.00$    52.44$    86.25$    140.00$     64.00$    $55.00 $57.21 100.00$     70.00$    No Bid 250.00$     78.00$    No Bid 75.00$    60.00$    No Bid 110.00$     45.00$    

51 53.00$    89.25$    No Bid 62.10$    132.25$     No Bid 72.00$    $65.00 $32.20 123.08$     85.00$    No Bid 250.00$     82.00$    No Bid 70.00$    55.00$    No Bid 135.00$     45.00$    

52 54.00$    78.75$    49.00$    60.72$    109.25$     155.00$     60.00$    $60.00 $47.27 107.69$     80.00$    No Bid 270.00$     95.00$    No Bid 65.00$    55.00$    No Bid 125.00$     45.00$    

53 37.00$    78.75$    51.00$    51.06$    143.75$     165.00$     65.00$    No Bid $47.07 192.31$     70.00$    225.00$     250.00$     112.00$     345.00$     75.00$    55.00$    No Bid 175.00$     45.00$    

54 50.00$    84.00$    35.00$    69.00$    109.25$     165.00$     65.00$    $45.00 $129.00 138.46$     85.00$    No Bid 250.00$     108.00$     No Bid 65.00$    55.00$    110.00$     150.00$     60.00$    

55 40.00$    57.00$    45.00$    44.16$    50.60$    No Bid 65.00$    No Bid $44.71 NO BID 103.00$     No Bid No Bid 83.00$    No Bid 65.00$    55.00$    No Bid 150.00$     39.00$    

56 26.00$    46.00$    42.00$    30.36$    26.45$    No Bid 32.00$    $35.00 $27.98 NO BID 55.00$    No Bid No Bid 58.00$    No Bid 50.00$    50.00$    No Bid 90.00$    39.00$    

57 78.00$    101.00$     45.00$    82.80$    82.00$    No Bid 80.00$    $48.00 $87.95 150.00$     110.00$     225.00$     285.00$     122.00$     390.00$     175.00$     65.00$    120.00$     140.00$     90.00$    

REMARKS:

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY:   Mayra Tobar, Purchasing Agent, Procurement & Warehousing Services

Recommend the Award be made to the above  Bidder(s) meeting specifications, terms, and conditions
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No Bid 49.50$    No Bid 34.53$    36.05$    65.00$    54.12$    48.90$    75.00$    45.00$    69.45$    No Bid 85.00$    55.00$    40.00$    59.00$    72.03$    No Bid 130.00$     

No Bid 61.20$    No Bid 37.99$    39.06$    72.00$    61.11$    59.60$    85.00$    65.00$    74.64$    No Bid 106.00$     65.00$    50.00$    69.00$    80.00$    No Bid 140.00$     

No Bid 72.00$    No Bid 41.44$    43.87$    85.00$    62.38$    68.00$    95.00$    75.00$    93.97$    No Bid 118.00$     75.00$    65.00$    84.00$    97.50$    No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 89.95$    No Bid 46.05$    48.07$    99.00$    63.93$    76.50$    100.00$     98.00$    95.46$    No Bid 127.00$     85.00$    72.00$    109.00$     119.99$     No Bid 160.00$     

80.00$    69.75$    55.00$    43.75$    46.87$    105.00$     68.11$    59.50$    85.00$    90.00$    83.29$    55.00$    130.00$     75.00$    65.00$    82.00$    80.50$    No Bid 170.00$     

90.00$    77.40$    65.00$    46.05$    51.08$    145.00$     69.66$    72.25$    95.00$    105.00$     93.29$    65.00$    166.00$     85.00$    77.00$    104.00$     102.44$     No Bid 180.00$     

No Bid 76.50$    85.00$    46.05$    56.25$    99.00$    78.60$    76.50$    110.00$     90.00$    92.61$    85.00$    140.00$     85.00$    85.00$    95.00$    112.45$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 94.50$    95.00$    52.96$    62.50$    120.00$     84.57$    76.50$    110.00$     110.00$     104.46$     95.00$    138.00$     80.00$    100.00$     110.00$     118.32$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 78.30$    No Bid 46.63$    48.07$    115.00$     68.71$    85.00$    110.00$     90.00$    89.77$    No Bid 135.00$     90.00$    85.00$    108.00$     110.84$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 76.05$    No Bid 46.63$    39.06$    90.00$    67.54$    85.00$    110.00$     75.00$    87.32$    No Bid 105.00$     90.00$    72.00$    105.00$     117.50$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 76.05$    No Bid 50.66$    62.50$    75.00$    78.48$    85.00$    100.00$     92.00$    87.57$    No Bid 125.00$     90.00$    72.00$    102.00$     100.03$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 72.00$    No Bid 34.53$    39.06$    90.00$    67.19$    85.00$    110.00$     75.00$    87.32$    No Bid 105.00$     90.00$    72.00$    97.00$    110.88$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 69.29$    65.00$    32.23$    36.06$    85.00$    68.09$    85.00$    100.00$     70.00$    87.57$    65.00$    125.00$     85.00$    68.00$    95.00$    79.97$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 54.00$    60.00$    31.07$    37.50$    52.00$    53.23$    72.25$    80.00$    55.00$    69.65$    60.00$    102.00$     70.00$    50.00$    62.00$    68.67$    No Bid 140.00$     

No Bid 66.60$    70.00$    34.53$    42.36$    65.00$    64.93$    76.50$    90.00$    70.00$    75.22$    70.00$    127.00$     78.00$    60.00$    84.00$    79.32$    No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 85.00$    80.00$    39.14$    47.17$    85.00$    73.40$    85.00$    100.00$     80.00$    86.15$    80.00$    136.00$     85.00$    72.00$    103.00$     104.55$     No Bid 160.00$     

No Bid 66.24$    80.00$    43.75$    47.50$    75.00$    53.24$    89.25$    90.00$    75.00$    87.63$    80.00$    115.00$     70.00$    70.00$    105.00$     95.99$    No Bid 160.00$     

No Bid 76.50$    100.00$     58.72$    53.75$    89.00$    67.34$    97.75$    110.00$     85.00$    98.86$    100.00$     130.00$     80.00$    75.00$    122.00$     117.32$     No Bid 170.00$     

No Bid 68.52$    90.00$    36.84$    51.98$    75.00$    73.49$    72.25$    100.00$     65.00$    80.73$    90.00$    117.00$     70.00$    69.75$    76.00$    68.12$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 67.50$    No Bid 34.53$    40.26$    90.00$    58.72$    78.75$    75.00$    85.00$    74.32$    No Bid 105.00$     70.00$    55.00$    88.00$    72.66$    No Bid No Bid

65.00$    35.53$    45.00$    23.01$    18.75$    38.00$    48.02$    55.25$    75.00$    35.00$    46.75$    45.00$    65.00$    45.00$    38.00$    46.00$    55.58$    No Bid 100.00$     

80.00$    44.10$    55.00$    24.86$    22.50$    51.00$    50.35$    68.00$    80.00$    45.00$    54.98$    55.00$    80.00$    55.00$    45.00$    58.00$    69.12$    No Bid 120.00$     

No Bid 57.15$    75.00$    24.16$    35.45$    67.00$    59.48$    85.00$    85.00$    60.00$    65.95$    75.00$    85.00$    55.00$    62.00$    63.00$    76.95$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 63.00$    95.00$    26.47$    39.06$    69.00$    59.94$    76.50$    75.00$    75.00$    84.67$    95.00$    135.00$     70.00$    69.00$    78.00$    65.04$    250.00$     No Bid

No Bid 58.50$    80.00$    32.23$    31.25$    72.00$    51.72$    68.00$    85.00$    65.00$    84.11$    80.00$    125.00$     75.00$    65.00$    67.00$    60.02$    250.00$     No Bid

No Bid 63.00$    90.00$    36.74$    37.50$    80.00$    65.90$    72.25$    85.00$    60.00$    79.97$    90.00$    135.00$     75.00$    70.00$    76.00$    75.88$    250.00$     No Bid

No Bid 63.00$    95.00$    32.23$    37.50$    80.00$    61.02$    80.75$    85.00$    75.00$    76.39$    95.00$    135.00$     75.00$    72.00$    80.00$    79.43$    250.00$     No Bid

No Bid 63.00$    85.00$    32.23$    37.50$    80.00$    61.30$    85.00$    85.00$    65.00$    84.95$    85.00$    125.00$     80.00$    72.00$    73.50$    50.03$    300.00$     No Bid

No Bid 62.10$    90.00$    34.53$    40.26$    95.00$    61.30$    102.00$     85.00$    60.00$    84.95$    90.00$    140.00$     85.00$    72.00$    84.00$    55.08$    250.00$     No Bid

55.00$    40.05$    65.00$    23.01$    36.05$    35.00$    36.06$    76.50$    85.00$    36.00$    54.95$    65.00$    55.00$    50.00$    45.00$    48.00$    45.56$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 85.00$    75.00$    32.23$    62.50$    64.00$    71.06$    93.50$    85.00$    95.00$    84.89$    75.00$    125.00$     95.00$    60.00$    85.00$    100.11$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 62.10$    65.00$    25.31$    45.67$    72.00$    59.17$    76.50$    85.00$    50.00$    84.89$    65.00$    105.00$     80.00$    62.00$    72.00$    95.67$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 103.50$     No Bid 52.96$    56.25$    95.00$    90.82$    76.50$    110.00$     130.00$     120.44$     No Bid 165.00$     90.00$    139.00$     147.00$     80.12$    No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 103.50$     No Bid 52.96$    56.25$    105.00$     94.42$    76.50$    110.00$     120.00$     118.45$     No Bid 145.00$     100.00$     120.00$     152.00$     102.69$     No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 103.90$     No Bid 52.96$    56.25$    105.00$     100.15$     93.50$    110.00$     105.00$     124.01$     No Bid 160.00$     110.00$     126.00$     138.00$     112.44$     No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 108.00$     No Bid 52.96$    42.06$    99.00$    98.40$    68.00$    110.00$     120.00$     125.04$     No Bid 170.00$     110.00$     140.00$     118.00$     105.66$     No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 106.20$     No Bid 52.96$    56.25$    110.00$     103.15$     68.00$    110.00$     120.00$     123.71$     No Bid 185.00$     125.00$     135.00$     112.00$     101.12$     No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 130.05$     No Bid 37.99$    69.11$    130.00$     113.82$     93.50$    110.00$     140.00$     138.72$     No Bid 175.00$     125.00$     145.00$     132.00$     115.32$     No Bid 175.00$     

No Bid 80.99$    No Bid 28.77$    62.50$    92.00$    102.20$     85.00$    110.00$     65.00$    95.98$    No Bid 85.00$    90.00$    80.00$    74.00$    85.12$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 54.00$    60.00$    37.99$    43.26$    68.00$    78.28$    42.50$    75.00$    60.00$    74.10$    60.00$    120.00$     60.00$    50.00$    63.00$    78.85$    No Bid 150.00$     

No Bid 59.00$    80.00$    41.44$    46.87$    85.00$    84.72$    62.50$    90.00$    70.00$    86.45$    80.00$    145.00$     70.00$    54.00$    75.00$    95.23$    No Bid 160.00$     

No Bid 67.00$    100.00$     50.66$    50.48$    95.00$    86.89$    76.50$    100.00$     85.00$    99.03$    100.00$     165.00$     80.00$    59.00$    90.00$    105.32$     No Bid 170.00$     

No Bid 90.00$    125.00$     52.40$    57.09$    115.00$     90.24$    89.25$    110.00$     95.00$    110.60$     125.00$     185.00$     90.00$    85.00$    110.00$     120.34$     No Bid 175.00$     

90.00$    61.20$    65.00$    37.99$    68.75$    84.00$    59.49$    72.25$    75.00$    65.00$    87.81$    65.00$    110.00$     70.00$    65.00$    90.00$    69.99$    No Bid 140.00$     

105.00$     72.00$    75.00$    43.75$    81.25$    104.00$     61.24$    80.75$    85.00$    75.00$    103.05$     75.00$    135.00$     80.00$    70.00$    112.00$     78.44$    No Bid 150.00$     

120.00$     85.50$    95.00$    48.36$    93.75$    114.00$     63.93$    89.25$    95.00$    80.00$    112.04$     95.00$    160.00$     90.00$    75.00$    136.00$     99.99$    No Bid 160.00$     

120.00$     89.31$    No Bid 64.48$    105.16$     115.00$     98.46$    106.25$     125.00$     90.00$    110.97$     No Bid 150.00$     100.00$     79.00$    138.00$     119.64$     No Bid No Bid

95.00$    83.25$    No Bid 50.66$    87.50$    95.00$    84.81$    110.50$     85.00$    80.00$    110.97$     No Bid 146.00$     90.00$    78.00$    132.00$     120.76$     No Bid No Bid

100.00$     90.00$    110.00$     55.27$    56.25$    90.00$    78.48$    77.00$    90.00$    85.00$    99.75$    110.00$     127.00$     95.00$    75.00$    127.00$     110.32$     No Bid No Bid

85.00$    69.00$    80.00$    35.68$    50.00$    85.00$    69.18$    72.00$    75.00$    75.00$    89.46$    80.00$    117.00$     85.00$    69.00$    100.00$     90.65$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 77.85$    No Bid 40.29$    60.00$    95.00$    63.40$    93.50$    85.00$    90.00$    94.72$    No Bid 160.00$     85.00$    70.00$    110.00$     100.46$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 76.50$    No Bid 49.51$    60.00$    84.00$    64.78$    76.50$    75.00$    90.00$    93.71$    No Bid 135.00$     85.00$    74.00$    105.00$     89.32$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 85.50$    No Bid 52.96$    50.00$    92.00$    44.18$    106.25$     95.00$    100.00$     115.46$     No Bid 196.00$     85.00$    72.00$    78.00$    112.78$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid 84.15$    No Bid 55.27$    56.25$    87.00$    68.06$    105.00$     80.00$    95.00$    119.37$     No Bid 185.00$     85.00$    79.50$    85.00$    115.34$     No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.23$    81.25$    145.00$     77.23$    114.75$     75.00$    78.00$    54.98$    No Bid 99.00$    80.00$    95.00$    110.00$     97.45$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid 45.00$    37.90$    24.03$    48.00$    25.30$    No Bid 75.00$    40.00$    54.98$    45.00$    55.00$    50.00$    60.00$    58.00$    70.12$    No Bid No Bid

No Bid 99.00$    120.00$     61.06$    69.11$    117.00$     55.45$    102.00$     110.00$     128.00$     115.69$     120.00$     195.00$     100.00$     78.00$    165.00$     121.34$     300.00$     175.00$     
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BID REJECTION SHEET 

ITB 19-049V 

TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES 

It is recommended that for reasons stated below, the bids as stated be rejected for not complying with bid 

requirements. 

1) Reject bid from Apex Systems, LLC.

Section 4, States:  To be submitted in time for bid opening: a. One signed hard-copy of the ITB

including the Bid Summary Sheet.

- Bidder is not responsive as they failed to submit a hard copy of the Bid Summary Sheet with

their proposal.

2) Reject bids from Synchronous Solutions, Virtucom, Inc., Optima Global Solutions, Inc., and

Labyrinth Solutions, Inc. d/b/a LSI Consulting.

Section 4, Condition 11 - Bidder’s References, states: “Bids will be considered only from firms

engaged in providing the services specified herein.  Bidders must provide a list of references from at

least three (3) established firms for whom bidder is presently providing the services specified in this

ITB on Exhibit C with their proposal.  Firms must have a location in the State of Florida.”

- The listed Bidders are not responsive as they failed to submit references from Firms located

in the State of Florida.  All references submitted are from out-of-state.

July 26, 2018 
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